
 

May 24, 2022 

Superintendent’s Message: Campus Safety 

Dear Parents, Guardians, Staff and Community Members, 

Sadly, we have learned of another horrific school shooting, this time in the Uvalde, Texas area. 
Our hearts and thoughts go out to the families and staff of Robb Elementary School. 

We understand that school safety is on the minds of students, parents, staff and community 
members. It is on our minds, as well. 

In this case, law enforcement believes the gunman is a high school student or graduate who 
entered the campus. In SMMUSD we have worked and continue to work to harden the 
perimeters and entrances to elementary school campuses. By creating better defenses, we 
reduce the potential threat. 

For middle and high school, there have been incidents where threats come from inside, by a 
student attending the school. Secondary schools require a different approach that 
predominantly focuses on reducing the threat through interventions prior to the person entering 
with a weapon. 

As with every other school shooting, Columbine, Sandy Hook and too many more, we will study 
what happened and strengthen our best practices to reduce threats. 

We have safety plans in place at each of our schools that we consistently review, evaluate and 
practice. You can find our general safety plan online. Each school plan is customized and 
updated annually. You may make an appointment with your school office to review your school’s 
plan. 

Santa Monica Police Department will be adding additional patrols to the schools both before, 
during and after school to provide a sense of security to our community. Additionally, we meet 
regularly with our local law enforcement officials, both the Santa Monica Police Department and 
the Los Angeles Sheriff’s Department, serving Malibu. These meetings include other city 
authorities and will focus on reviewing our current safety plans and discussing additional 
preventive and proactive measures that may be taken to better protect our students and staff 
from acts of violence.  

We regularly review our threat assessment protocols with our staff and local mental health 
professional partners. We continue to encourage staff, students, and community members that 
if they “See something, Say Something.”  Additionally, reporting concerns to school staff, calling 
911, and/or utilizing WETIP is strongly encouraged. 

Student and staff safety are our top priorities. It is our goal to engage students in schools that 
are safe, well-maintained and family friendly.  

https://www.smmusd.org/cms/lib/CA50000164/Centricity/Shared/SchoolSafetyPlan.pdf
https://www.wetip.com/submit-a-tip/


Here are three resources that may be helpful to you and your family during times of school 
tragedies:  

● National Association of School Psychologists: Talking to Children About Violence: Tips 
for Parents and Teachers 

● National Child Traumatic Stress Network: Parent Guidelines for helping youth after a 
shooting 

● Common Sense Media: How to Talk to Kids About Violence, Crime and War 

Please continue to take care of yourselves and each other. 

Sincerely, 

Dr. Ben Drati, Superintendent  

 

https://r20.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=00132n7heGdYtOolZ69BMCqECEdq29UhJPCYz7Ya9MrePXtkkQup-VDjB6ZJ3W6UJV78O1GEG2qd9CCaikZNIPD9szB9QUAu0zIq-Po0dJ47SRIiKawA6-Ldz3uILlm2FTKv82L_l-LLvDOVC6ipdy0i1Wa4X3spHCq08HZqlBgA7SSHY_CoJBYvZdsr1oWVTv7nDY29mE11kPcPLxYA93SPMjCL6z0-oyOYjKw4U-MPepA-xoER_sIRlf5ZDolVlSG6GqQyISuRdqC0g-y2AawNJ942KIa0W8Ag3rkeUOqcIvARn85Dig0iGcKQgEWW1-TrWAnYqiYjzdPqaPQYzoh8TyH6hIyP9BKl2wzchFcXBhckuDX32cLAddnZDYBmL9V&c=buokRgAfRafR5-bHyraxrybMk638DVAoVa98uNHrDXAtgN-UCylp8Q==&ch=tsE3bHDIs1EHqSP8du7M07V5cT_alQxRfxmN2uzbNu7uM_s0YtA24w==
https://r20.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=00132n7heGdYtOolZ69BMCqECEdq29UhJPCYz7Ya9MrePXtkkQup-VDjB6ZJ3W6UJV78O1GEG2qd9CCaikZNIPD9szB9QUAu0zIq-Po0dJ47SRIiKawA6-Ldz3uILlm2FTKv82L_l-LLvDOVC6ipdy0i1Wa4X3spHCq08HZqlBgA7SSHY_CoJBYvZdsr1oWVTv7nDY29mE11kPcPLxYA93SPMjCL6z0-oyOYjKw4U-MPepA-xoER_sIRlf5ZDolVlSG6GqQyISuRdqC0g-y2AawNJ942KIa0W8Ag3rkeUOqcIvARn85Dig0iGcKQgEWW1-TrWAnYqiYjzdPqaPQYzoh8TyH6hIyP9BKl2wzchFcXBhckuDX32cLAddnZDYBmL9V&c=buokRgAfRafR5-bHyraxrybMk638DVAoVa98uNHrDXAtgN-UCylp8Q==&ch=tsE3bHDIs1EHqSP8du7M07V5cT_alQxRfxmN2uzbNu7uM_s0YtA24w==
https://www.nctsn.org/resources/parent-guidelines-helping-youth-after-recent-shooting
https://www.nctsn.org/resources/parent-guidelines-helping-youth-after-recent-shooting
https://www.commonsensemedia.org/articles/how-to-talk-to-kids-about-violence-crime-and-war
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